PROCEEDINGS OF THE POLICE JURY, PARISH OF OUACHITA,
STATE OF LOUISIANA, TAKEN AT A REGULAR MEETING HEL D ON,
MONDAY, DECEMBER 7, 2009 AT 5:32 P.M.

The Police Jury of the Parish of Ouachita, Statdafisiana met in a regular session in the
Ouachita Parish Police Jury Meeting Room, Courtbddsilding, Monroe, Louisiana on Monday,

December 7, 2009 at 5:32 p.m., and was duly convened by Mre Shaitey, President, who stated

that the Police Jury was ready for the transactidousiness.

Members Present (5)
Charles Jackson District A
Mack Calhoun District B
Ollibeth Reddix District D
Shane Smiley District E
Pat Moore District F
Members Absent (1)

Walt Caldwell District C

The invocation was given by Mr. Smiley. The Pledge of Allegiance to the flageddy Mr.
Smiley.

A motion to adopt the Minutes of the Regular Police Jury Meeting imguthe Committee
meetings held on October 26November %, November ¥, November 16, and November
239 2009 was offered by Dr. Reddix, seconded by Ms. Moore with correctionshe
November 2% minutes. Motion passed without opposition.

VISITORS:

The president recognized visitor Lisa Richardson, Ouachita Parish Floolaaager. Ms.
Richardson spoke extensively regarding the new flood plain maps and indicated thas change
made to the maps would affect homeowners in all districts. Ms. Richardson noted that the
changes would place some residents in a flood zone and take others out of a flood zone. Ms.
Richardson stated that it was very important to get the information out to thentesaafford

them time to purchase flood insurance at a reduce cost. Discussion ensued.

Mr. Caldwell came in during the discussion.

Ms. Richardson indicated that the appeal process was within 90 days. Discussidragasue

Ms. Moore indicated that this matter was listed as an item on her agenda and askedarhet

not anyone had a problem with addressing it at this time. No one had a problem with taking up
the matter at this time. Motion offered by Ms. Moore, seconded by Mr. Jackson Anthdts.
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Richardson to set up a meeting with the other municipalities, to discuss wayshe g
information out to the public. Motion passed with Mr. Caldwell abstaining.

The president recognized Mr. Willie Scott of 59 Langford Drive spoke regardinip tiuinig
problems within the Pine Bayou Subdivision and asked for assistance from the jury. Ms. Moor
expressed thanks to Mr. Scott for his attendance, and indicated that she along witislthe pa
engineer would be looking into the matter. Ms. Moore stated that she would get back with M
Scott after looking into the matter. No other action was taken on this matter.

DEPARTMENT HEAD REPORTS
The president asked that the jury would allow him to address ¢parbnent Heads Reports at
this time. The following department head presented monthly reports.

GREEN OAKS: Mike Rhodes, Director
Mr. Rhodes stated that his monthly report reflected the breakdown on the kids held in the
facility.

OCC CORRECTIONS: Major Brian Newcomer

Major Newcomer spoke regarding the building of the additional building at the japlace the
tents. Bill Land, Architect spoke regarding the matter and recommended theicomsiof a
100-bed minimum-security facility. Discussion ensued. Motion offered by Mr. Calhoun,
seconded by Mr. Caldwell to authorize the construction of a 100 minimum security faeihd
the plans to the state Fire Marshal for approval, advertise for bids, and pag thedi designs
and inspections by the architect as stated in his letter. Motion passed witldBix &estaining.

911 OFFICE: Mr. Craig Lott
Mr. Lott offer his office services to assist Ms. Richardson in disseminatiognation regarding
the new flood plain maps.

WIA
Ms. Bennett noted that the annual report from the state was included in each jutats pac

The president requested a motion to recess the regular meeting in favor ot ele
Committee meeting. Motion offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Calhoun to theess
regular meeting and convene as the Personnel Committee. Motion passed withouboppositi

PERSONNEL COMMITTEE MEETING

The chairperson, Ms. Moore called the committee meeting to order at 6:25 p.riviobte
spoke regarding the Human Resource Request Form and asked that the jury review it. Ms
Moore stated that she would bring the matter back at the next Personnel Meeting.
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The chairperson recognized Mr. Cammack. Mr. Cammack spoke regarding the jottidescri
of the Special Projects Coordinator and recommended approval. Motion offered by Mr.
Calhoun, seconded by Mr. Smiley to accept the job description of Special Projeas&toor
as recommended. Motion passed without opposition.

Mr. Cammack spoke regarding the request to hire an accountant. Mr. Cammack recammende
the hiring of Robin White, effective December 14, 2009. Motion offered by Mr. Jackson,
seconded by Mr. Calhoun to accept the recommendation of the Treasurer to hire Robin White
the position of Accountant effective December 14, 2009. Motion passed with Mr. Caldwell
abstaining.

Ms. Moore recognized Chief Hemphill, Fire Department. Chief Hemphill preséme
following personnel items and recommended approval.

SICK LEAVE

Cardwell, Keith Extended Sick Leave Effective 10/20/09
Hill, Kevin Extended Sick Leave Effective 11/10/09
Counts, Hugh S Extended Sick Leave Effective 11/20/09
Bush, Jessie Termination of Extended Sick Leave Effective 11/04/09
Felts, David Extended Sick Leave Effective 11/26/09

Motion offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Smiley to accept the persormel a
recommended by the chief. Motion passed without opposition.

ADMINISTRATIVE LEAVE
| Odom, Steve | Administrative Leave with Pay |  Effective 11/18/09 |

Motion offered by Mr. Jackson, seconded by Mr. Calhoun to accept the recommendation of the
chief. Motion passed without opposition.

Ms. Moore informed the jury that the personnel matter concerning Stephen T. Odom would be
addressed at the end of the regular meeting. There was no objection to thibenagtéaken up
at that time.

Ms. Moore asked if there was any other business to come before the Personnet&mmi
There was none, the committee meeting was adjourned at 6:30 p.m.

The president requested a motion to convene as the Public Works Committee. Motion gffered b
Mr. Jackson, seconded by Mr. Calhoun to convene the Public Works Committee. Motion passed
without opposition.
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PUBLIC WORKS COMMITTEE MEETING

The chairman, Mr. Calhoun called the Public Works Committee meeting to order at 6:30 p.m.

The chairman recognized Mr. Murray, Public Works Director. Mr. Murray spoleedeg the
Resubdivision of Lots 6, 7, and 8 of Unit 1 Chauvin Place located in District E. Mr. Holtzclaw,
Engineer stated that there were no problems with the request. Motion offered byiMy, S
seconded by Mr. Caldwell to accept the recommendation of the resubdivision of lots 6, 7, and 8
of Chauvin Place. Motion passed without any opposition.

Mr. Murray spoke regarding the resubdivision of lots 38 and 39 of Pleasant Valley Subdivision
located in District A. Mr. Holtzclaw stated that he had reviewed the request and found no
problems. Motion offered by Mr. Jackson, seconded by Mr. Caldwell to approve the
resubdivision as recommended. Motion passed without any opposition.
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
AGGREGATES- 2010
BID #09-1103014
NOVEMBER 3, 2007

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

CONTRACT A= LIMESTONE

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY

GROUP C - TERRAL RIVERSERVICE

BID PACKETS WERE SENT TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS:

BIG RIVER IND. - D & J CONSTRUCTION - R E BENTZ - LA INDUSTRIES - J D CAYER & CO.-
CENTURY READY MIX - DIAMOND B CONSTRUCTION - STANDARD GRAVEL. CO. INC. - TERRAL RIVER

NOVEMBER 3, 2009
ITEM: AGGREGATES LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
CONTRACT -A BIDS
VENDORS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 material
1500 TON - $ 32.00 Lightweight Aggregate | 1000ton $ 37.00 | 2500 TON
700 TON - $ NO BID C-2 crushed $32.75
TERRAL RIVERSERVICE Gourse Aggregats Seciion 2000 ton § 37.00
10033 ASTM C-330 C-3 crushed
30001on$ 37.00 | AsTO M43 #56
Section 1003.05
Subtotal Est. Cost Subtotal Estimated | Subtotal Est. Subtotal Est. Gost
Cost Cost
$ 48,000.00 $ NOBID $ 222,000.00 $81,875.00
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 matenal
1500 TON - $ NO BID Lightweight Aggregate | 1000 ton $ NOBID | 2500 TON -
TO0TON-$NOBID | ¢ 9 crughed $ NOBID
BIG RIVER INDUSTRIES Course Aggregate Section 2000ton $ NOBID
1003.3 ASTM C-330 C-3 crushed
3000 ton $ NO BID ASHTO M43 #56
CENTURY READY-MIX Subtotal Est. Cost Subtotal Estimated | Section 1003.05
e $ NO BID Cost Subtotal Est Subtotal Est. Cost
UDEO! si.
$NOBID Cost $ NOBID
$NOBID
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 matenal
1500 TON - $ NOBID Lightweight Aggregate | 1000 ton $NOBID | 2500 TON -
I 700 TON - $ NO BID R
J & K TRANSPORT, INC. Cotrse Aggragate Section SNOBD | G2 cushed $NOBID
2000 ton $ NO BID
1003.3 ASTM C-330 I
C-3 crushed ASHTO M43 #56
3000 ton $ NO BID
R. E. BENTZ, INC.
R Subtotal Est. Cost S i Gost | Secton 100305 | Subtotal Est. Cost
$ NOBID $ NOBID Subtotal Est.
NOBID Cost $NOBID
$NOBID
RECOMMENDATIONS:
GROUP A - TERRAL RIVERSERVICE GROUP B - NOBID

GROUP D - TERRAL RIVERSERVICE

OPPJ Minutes

December 7, 2009

Page 5 of 41




OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
AGGREGATES- 2010
BID # 09-1103016

NOVEMBER 3, 2007 Page 1 of 2 - FINAL
CONTRACT B= GRANITE
DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009
ITEM: AGGREGATES LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
CONTRACT -B BIDS
VENDORS GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROQUP D
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed granite 56 material
1500 TON - $ 26.00 Lightweight Aggregate 1000 ton $ NO BID 2500 TON -
T00TON-$80.00 | c.p crushed granite $ NOBID
Course Aggregate Section 3000 ton $ NO BID
W 1003.3 ASTM C-330 C-3 crushed granite
4000 ton $ NOBID ASHTO M43 #56
Section 1003.05
Subtotal Est. Cost f;';‘s’:"“" Estimated | g ptotal Est. Subtotal Est. Cost
$ 39,000.00 $6300000 | °¥ho i $ NOBID
Crushed Stone / Base I_Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 material
1500 TON - $ NO BID ightweight Aggregate 2500 TON -
e TOOTON-$4453 | booond-—— s
Course Aggregate Section ( CUBIC YARDS ) 3000ton$
BIG RIVER INDUSTRIES 1003.3 C-3 crushed
= ASTM C-330 4000 ton § ASHTO M43 #56
* Price includes a ]
monthly (national) Subtotal Est. Cost Subtotal Estimated Section 1003.05 Subtotal Est. Cost
average fuel surcharge Cost Subtotal Est.
that varies monthly. Cost
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 material
1500 TON - $ 28.25 Lightweight Aggregate 1000 ton $ 29.50 2500 TON - $ 30.50
J & K TRANSPORT, INC 7oToN-SNOBID | £ 5 35.00
LSRN INANDTRIR, TN, i 3000 ton $ 35.00
oy agregate Secton ASTM C-330 €3 crushed ASHTO M43 #56
4000 ton $ 36.00
Section 1003.05 Subtotal Est. Cost
Subtotal Subtotal Est.
Subtotal Est. Cost Estimated Cost Cost
$ 42 375.00 $ NO BID $ 278,500.00 $ 76.250.00
RECOMMENDATIONS:
GROUP A - CENTURY READY-MIX GROUP B - BIGRIVER INDUSTRIES
GROUP C - J & K TRANSPORT GROUP D - J & K TRANSPORT

BID PACKETS WERE SENT TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS:

BIG RIVER IND. - D & J CONSTRUCTION - R E BENTZ - LA INDUSTRIES - J D CAYER & CO.-
CENTURY READY MIX - DIAMOND B CONSTRUCTION - STANDARD GRAVEL CO. INC. - TERRAL RIVER

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 6 of 41




DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

ITEM: AGGREGATES

OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
AGGREGATES- 2010
BID # 09-1103016
NOVEMBER 3, 2007

Page 2 of 2 - FINAL

CONTRACT B= GRANITE

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY

NOVEMBER 3, 2009

LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

CONTRACT -B BIDS
VENDORS GROUP A GROUP B GRQUP C GROUP D
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed granite 56 material
1500 TON - § 26.95 Lightwetght Aggregate 1000 ton $ 31.60 2500 TON -
T00TON-$NOBID | ) orusheaar—a—nite $ 30.55
Course Aggregate Section 3000 ton § 37.35
R. E. BENTZ, INC. 1003.3 ASTM C-330 C-3 crushed granite
4000 ton $ 37.70 ASHTO M43 #56

Section 1003.05
Subtotal Est. Cost Subtotal Estimated | Subtotal Est. | gyptotal Est. Cost
Cost Cost
$ 40,425.00 $ NO BID $ 294,450.00 $ 76,375.00
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 material
TER RIVERSERVICE 500 TON - $ NO BID Lightweight Aggregate 1000 ton $ 2500 TON —
700TON-SNOBID | ¢ ryched $ NO BID
Course Aggregate Section 3000 ton $
10033 ASTM C-330 C-3 crushed
4000ton $ ASHTO M43 #56
Subtotal Estimated | Section 1003.05
Subtotal Est. Cost Cost Subtotal Est. Cost
Subtotal Est.
Cost
$ NOBID $ NOBID $ NO BID $NOBID
Crushed Stone / Base Expanded Clay C-1 crushed 56 materiat
D& J CONSTRUCTION 1500 TON - $ NO REPLY Lightweight Aggregate 1000 fon § 9500 TON -
700 TON — C-2 crushed $ NO REPLY
DIAMOND B CONSTRUCT $ NO REPLY 3000 ton $ B—
Course Aggregate Section C-3 crushed ASHTO M43 #56
J D CAVER & COMPANY 1003.3 ASTM C-330 4000 ton $
LOUISIANA INDUSTRIES Section 1003.05 Subtotal Est. Cost
Subtotal Subtotal Est.
STANDARD GRAVEL Subtotal Est. Cost Estimated Cost | Cost
$ NO REPLY $ NOREPLY $ NOREPLY $ NO REPLY
RECOMMENDATIONS:

GROUP A - CENTURY READY-MIX
GROUP ¢ - J & K TRANSPORT

GROUP B - BIG RIVER INDUSTRIES

GROUP D - J&KTRANSPORT

BID PACKETS WERE SENT TO THE FOLLOWING VENDORS:

BIGRIVER IND. -D & J CONSTRUCTION - R E BENTZ - LA INDUSTRIES - J D CAYER & CO. -
CENTURY READY MIX - DIAMOND B CONSTRUCTION - STANDARD GRAVEL CO. INC. - TERRAL RIVER
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

ITEM: ANTIFREEZE & COOLANT

ANTIFREEZE - 2010
BID # 09-1103017

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009

LOCATION:

POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

CASE CASE
e vonee | (6 AL PicsE) (6 GAL PICSE)
: EST. USAGE EST. USAGE
3 DRUMS APy 4Pl TOTAL BID AMOUNT
VENDORS BIDS BIDS BIDS
(CROW BURLINGAME ) NO REPLY
BUMPER TO BUMPER
CENTRAL OIL &
SUPPPLY 329.45 EA 37.35 eA 66.95 ea 3,821.35
GRIMM MGMT
RESOURCES INC. 1,011.53 EA 121.50 EA 60.66 EA 9,107.79
HILL OIL
(FARMERVILLE, LA 319.00 Ea 36.00 A 54.00 ea 3,477.00
NAPA AUTO PARTS NO REPLY
NORTHEAST TRUCK
& TRAILER NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION: HILL OIL

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on bid tab
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DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

BID TABULATION FORM
ASPHALT - 2010
BID # 09-1103018

OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY

NOVEMBER 3, 2007
ITEM: ASPHALT LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
GROUP A GROUP B
VENDORS BIDS BIDS TYPE-ANALYSIS
*]|
$ 76.500.00 *B CRS-2? $204 CRS-2P $2.76
TOTAL EST. COST CRS-2P MODIFED  $2.56
ASPHALT PRODUCTS UNLIMITED INC. MC-30 $886.450.00 > AEP $221 CSS1 $244
EST. QTY. 25,000
$3.06/GAL
*B CRS2 § CRS-2P S _ .
BLACKLEDGE EMULSIONS, INC. TOTALEST.COST | g > b s o1 s
MC-30 - =
* EST. QTY. 25,000
PACKET RETURNED 3 1 GAL
$ NOREPLY TBCRS2S . CRSPS .
TOTAL EST. COST CRS-2P MODIFIED _ § .
DIAMOND B PETROLEUM >
MC-30 ¥ NOREPLY AEP_§ Css-1_$
EST. QTY. 25,000
$ / GAL
*B CRS2 $1.995 CRS-2P $2.705
$ 81,375.00
DAVISON PETROLEUM SUPPLY, LLC TOTAL EST. COST CRS-2P MODIFIED $2.495
MC-30 $ 86777500 > AEP_$2295 CSS1_$2245
EST. QTY. 25,000
$3.255 / GAL
O *BCRS2S CRS2P §
TOTAL EST. COST
EAGLE ASPHALT PRODUCTS CRS2PMODIHED S .
MC-30 $ NOREPLY > AEP S csst s
EST. QTY. 25,000 = -
$ . IGAL
- *BCRS2S_ . CRSPPS .
TOTAL EST. COST CRS.2P MODIFED
5 DS .
GILCHRIST CONSTRUCTION CO. MC-30 $ NOREPLY > P s
EST. QTY. 25,000 AEP $ . G
$ 1 GAL
___ *B CRS2S CRS2P S .
KOCH MATERIALS TOTAL EST. COST $ NO REDLY CRS-2P MODIFIED __§
MC-30 >
EST. QTY. 25,000 AEP S . €51
$ 1GAL
—— *B CRS2 S CRS-2P S .
LINCOLN ASPHALT TOTAL EST. COST CRS-2P MODIFED_§
MC-30 $ >
* PACKET RETURNED EST. QTY. 25,000 AEP § . CS5l §
$ i / GAL
[ *B CRS-2 § CRS-2P §
T.L. JAMES & COMPANY TOTAL EST. COST CRS-2P MODIFED _§ .
MC-30 $NOREPLY >
EST. QTY. 25,000 AEP_ S . cssl S
$ . / GAL

RECOMMENDATION:

GROUP- A: ASPHALT PRODUCTS UNLIMITED INC

GROUP- B: DAVISON PETRCLEUM SUPPLY, LLC

* BID PACKETS WERE SENT TO ALL VENDORS LISTED
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
ASPHALTIC CONCRETE-2010
BID # 09-1103019
NOVEMBER 3, 2009
DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009
ITEM: ASPHALTIC CONCRETE LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
CONTRACT A | CONTRACT B
VENDORS BIDS BIDS COMMENTS

ASPHALT PRODUCTS UNLIMT'D NO REPLY NO REPLY
BLACKLEDGE EMULSION PACKEY RETURNED
D & J CONSTRUCTION $ 71.00P/TON | $ NOBID
DIAMOND B CONSTRUCTION $ NOBID $ 70.50 PITON
EAGLE ASPHALT PRODUCTS NO REPLY NQO REPLY
ERGON NO REPLY NO REPLY
KOCH MATERIALS CO NO REPLY NO REPLY
LINCOLN ALSPHALT PACKET RETURNED
LOUISIANA INDUSTRIES NO REPLY NO REPLY
PAUL DAVISON NO REPLY NO REPLY
TL JAMES & CO. NO REPLY NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION:

CONTRACT-A CONTRACT-B

D & J CONSTRUCTION DIAMOND B CONSTRUCTION

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on bid tab.
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY

BID TABULATION FORM
BATTERIES-2010
BID # 09-1103020

DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

ITEM: BATTERIES

DATE: NOVEMBER 3, 2009
TIME: 10:00 A.M.

LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

VENDOR BID AMOUNT COMMENTS
BATTERIES PLUS NO REPLY
CROW BURLINGAME 908.00
D & C BATTERIES INC. dba
INTERSTATE BATTERIES NO REPLY
OF MONROE
D & J CONSTRUCTION NO REPLY
GRIMM MGMT RESOURCES INC 779.60
INTERSTATE ALL BATTERY NO REPLY
CTR
NAPA AUTO PARTS
LOUISVILLE AVE, MONROE 769.90
NAPA AUTO & TRUCK PARTS NO REPLY
RUSTON, LA
MASLINE ELECTRONICS, INC. NO REPLY
MCKOIN’S STARTER NO REPLY
MOTOR PARTS SERVICE CO. 818.77
MOTION INDUSTRIES NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION: NAPA AUTO PARTS — MONROE (LOUISVILLE AVENUE)

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on bid tab.
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
BRIDGE TIMBERS & PILING-2010

BID # 09-1103021 * 2 Pages
DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009
ITEM: BRIDGE TIMBERS & PILINGS LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
BIEWER LUMBER LLC GROUP A GROUP B
: FT- EA6X20- $8590
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP A 30w oFr ot SN
2997.10 REEL X024 T8G - $127.15
EX1ZX16- §133.40
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP B 45T s o | S g’—gﬂl‘l
$ 1200 PIFT 6°X16"X20'- $ 252.60
$ 97.618.40 - win S4S SOFT- 12°X12°%24'§ 442.60
N $ 1200 PFT £X10°X24° PLANKING $ 122.10
99,638.00 -wtHT & G
8'%67%20-  § 12570
KENNEDY SAW MILLS INC zré WSPFT | 4XI0K04. 545, TAG § 13240
6 X12'X16- § 14832
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP A | | wFt ot & 1oL
5 S248PFT 12X12X248 57672
$2,585.75 N FE {38 PET 47X10°X24' PLANKING $ 123,60
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP B BAPRFT
$ 112,651.60
30ET- 66 "X20- § 10240
LUFKIN CREOSOTING %;MW XX, 548, TG § 20050
swgaerr | SEXE § 180
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP A o ot oo ; %
45FT- [r24n
$2,163.80 s 1213PFT £X10°%24' PLANKING $ 232.50
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP B "% stwerr
$ 158,390.75
WOOD PRESERVING INC.
sor; oot X670 $ 8160
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP A at X028, 45, T8 ; o s a8
$1ai68 ML
F.0.B. toswsls?)'ll; MO:_IROE o Fg_s@PfFr ATXIZXAS 2048
$ 550.00 on piling $958 PFT £7X10°X24' PLANKING § 116.00
50FT-
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST- GROUP B $S56PFT
$ 94,660.80
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST
RIVERSIDE CONSTRUCTION NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION:
GROUP-A & GROUP-B: WOOD PRESERVING INC.

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on the bid tab.
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
BRIDGE TIMBERS & PILING-2010
BID # 09-1103021 * 2 Pages
DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009
ITEM: BRIDGE TIMBERS & PILINGS LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
GROUP A GROUP B
BID BID
VENDORS PER FOOT PRICE PER TIMBER TOTAL ESTIMATED COST
30FT- XX $_
swpr ——"TT | a0, SIS TEG§___.__
s pEr |SX2xiels
o S —
BAYOU FOREST PRODUCTS “ FT$____?IFT ?;x;?%“ j —— NO BID
$__ PFT | #XICX4PLANKING-$_ .
50 F1-
$_. PIFT
30FT-
E¥6X20- §__
wrr— "7 | axi0xos, 45, TRG-§ .
COBB LUMBER COMPANY T | et 4 NO BID
$ . BFT XtoX20- §_
45FT. 1TXIZXA-$ .
$ . PFT | 4X10X24 PLANKINGS .
B0 FT-
30FT-
1 | gxgxe0- §
s PIFT | #X10X2¢, 945, T8G $
CONROE WOOD PRODUCTS 10FE EXIZX-§_
$ pIFT | 6X16716- NO BID
45FT- EX167X20- §
$ PFT | 12X12X24$
50FT- #X10°X24' PLANKING §
$ PIFT
30FT-
§ T |
CONTECH CONSTRUCTION wE o, G TEe S
” EX1ZX16- §
msﬁ PIET | 6'X16'X16- § NO BID
s5FT- EX16°%20- § ~
$ PIFT | 12x12%2¢$
S0FT- #X10°%X24 PLANKING $
$ PIFT
WET-
E46X20- $
GEMINI FOREST s | X1, 845,785 5 NO BID
oi——F LexiXes
R J TRADING GROUP e ggg)’gg g——
s P | 12xizxees
TYCO VENTURES LLC o e £X10°X24’ PLANKING $
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
CEMENT-PORTLAND 2010
BID # 09-1103022
NOVEMBER 3, 2009

DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

ITEM: CEMENT- PORTLAND

TIME: 10:00 AM- TUESDAY
DATE: NOVEMBER 3, 2009

LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

VENDOR BID

COMMENTS

$ 138.34 periton

DEMURRAGE CHARGES START AFTER _2 HOURS

ASH GROVE CEMENT CO. DEMURRAGE HOURLY RATE - $ 40.00
DEMURRAGE CHARGES START AFTER _1 HOUR
CENTURY READY MIX $ 145.00 perfton
DEMURRAGE HOURLY RATE - $ 60.00
DEMURRAGE CHARGES START AFTER HOURS
LA INDUSTRIES $ NO REPLY E—

DEMURRAGE HOURLY RATE - $

TXt OPERATIONS, LP $ 142.14 perfton

DEMURRAGE CHARGES START AFTER _t1 HOUR
DEMURRAGE HOURLY RATE - $ 35.00

DEMURRAGE CHARGES START AFTER HOURS
DEMURRAGE HOURLY RATE - § .

RECOMMENDATION: ASH GROVE CEMENT COMPANY

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on bid tab.
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

BID TABULATION FORM

CULVERTS-2010
BID # 09-1103023

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009

ITEM: CULVERTS LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
GROUP A | GROUP B | GROUPC GROUP D
VENDORS BIDS BIDS BIDS
CENTRAL SUPPLY NO REPLY NOREPLY | NOREPLY NO REPLY
COBURN'S SUPPLY NO BID NO BID 44,290.00 NO BID
COASTAL CULVERT & SUPPLY NO BID 271,015.68 46,485.00 22.755.00
CONTECH CONSTRUCTION PROD INC. NO BID 240,160.00 NO BID 23,895.00
CROW BURLINGGAME NOREPLY | NOREPLY | NOREPLY NO REPLY
EWING IRRIGATION NOREPLY | NOREPLY | NOREPLY NO REPLY
GIFFORD HILL CONCRETE RPAGKET
HANSON PIPE & PRECAST INC. NO REPLY NO REPLY NO REPLY NO REPLY
KEELING COMPANY NO BID NO BID 45,743.00 NO BID
LOUISIANA INDUSTRIES NOREPLY | NOREPLY | NOREPLY NO REPLY
SOUTHWEST SALES 31,084.80 354,724.50 46,935.00 46,463.00
WEST FEED MILL NO BID NO BID 47,189.50 NO BID
RECOMMENDATION:

GROUP A SOUTHWEST SALES

GROUP B CONTECH CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS INC.

GROUP C COBURN'S SUPPLY

GROUP D COASTAL CULVERTS & SUPPLY INC.

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY

DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS

BID TABULATION FORM
FILL DIRT-2010
BID # 09-1103024

DATE: NOVEMBER 3, 2009

TIME: 10:00 A.M

ITEM: FILL DIRT LOCATION: POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM
VENDOR BID COMMENTS
ALLSTATE ENTERPRISE, LLC NO REPLY
B & S ENTERPRISE, INC NO REPLY
BILLY TAYLOR CONT NO REPLY
PAC of LOUISIANA NQ REPLY
$ 1.90 per yard
DENNIS CARPENTER CONT $ 57.000.00
TOTAL EST. COST
PACKET RETURNED
SPRUELL CONTRACTING
PACKET RETURNED
HEMPHILL DIRT
HOBSON & SON, LLC NO REPLY
. peryard

OWENS CONT

TOTAL EST. COST

RECOMMENDATION: Request to reject bid & re-advertise at earliest opportunity.

* Packets were sent to all vendors listed

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 16 of 41




OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM

DEPARTMENT: PUBLIC WORKS

ITEM: ALL FILTERS

FILTERS-2010

BID # 09-1103025

TIME: 10:00 AM - TUESDAY
NOVEMBER 3, 2009

LOCATION:

POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

BID
VENDOR AMOUNT COMMENTS
ADVANCE AUTO PARTS NO REPLY
CROW BURLINGAME
(BUMPER TO BUMPER) 15,032.62
GRIMM MGMT, RESOURCES 15,870.05
NAPA AUTO PARTS 14,470.34
NORTHEAST TRUCK &
TRAILER NQO REPLY
O'REILLY’S AUTO PARTS 16,752.46
Vendor did not bid on 18 items. The listed total of
Egn.m-rsi.i‘;::ﬁ}?ggmc 14.544.89 items bid was 13,313.63 + adj. amounts with NAPA
a Il i bid amounts equals 14,544.89.
UNITED ENGINES NO REPLY
MOTION INDUSTRIES NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION: NAPA AUTO PARTS - MONROE (Louisville Avenue)

* Packets were sent to all vendors listed
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OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY
BID TABULATION FORM
LUBRICATION OIL
BID #09-1103026
NOVEMBER 3, 2009

DEPT: PUBLIC WORKS DATE: NOVEMBER 3, 2009

TIME: 10:00 A.M.

ITEM: LUBRICATION OIiL LOCATION:
POLICE JURY CONFERENCE ROOM

VENDOR BID AMOUNT COMMENTS

CENTRAL OIL & SUPPLY 103,807.94

CROW BURLINGAME /

BUMPER TO BUMPER NO REPLY

HILL OIL. (FARMERVILLE) 54.605.00

NAPA AUTO PARTS NO REPLY

NORTHEAST TRUCK &

TRAILER NO REPLY

RECOMMENDATION:  HILL OIL COMPANY

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on the bid tab.
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NEWMAN TRAFFIC SIGNS 19,064.50 14,835.00
OSBURN 17,214.65 NOBID
RICHARD COMEAUX NO REPLY
ROCHAL INC. NO REPLY
ROCAL, NG 7850 | | NOBID | i T e coulto i
20,678.50
UNIVERSIVAL DIE-CUT CORP NOREPLY
VULCAN ALUMINUM 16.482.00 14,757.00
WHITCO SIGN & MFG CORP NO REPLY
RECOMMENDATION:

GROUP A: VULCAN ALUMINUM *The apparent low bid of Custom Products for Group A was not complete
and the apparent 27 lowest bid from ROCAL, INC. has mathematical

errors.

GROUP B: CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATION

* Bid packets were sent to all vendors listed on bid tab.

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 19 of 41



Motion offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Jackson to accept the recommendatioms of
Treasurer on all bid tabulations as presented with the lowest conforming bid; ahcerase for
fill dirt. Motion passed without opposition.

There being no other business to come before this committee, a motion to adjourn wdshgffer
Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Jackson. The committee meeting was adjournédl @inG.

Motion offered by Mr. Jackson, seconded by Mr. Calhoun to convene as the Finance Committee
Motion passed without opposition.

FINANCE COMMITTEE MEETING

The Finance Committee meeting was called to order by the chairman,ckBodat 6:40 p.m.
Mr. Jackson stated that the remainder of the bid tabulations would be addressed ag.tHi4rtim
Cammack presented the following bid tabulations for approval.
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Mr. Cammack and Ms. Hunter commented on the bid tab results for chemicals for Mosquito
Abatement and yard maintenance at the parish libraries. A brief distessioed. Motion
offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Smiley to accept the recommenslaii the
Treasurer on all bid tabulations as presented with the lowest conforming bid notaxgdipéon
of the yard maintenance for the library. Motion passed without opposition.

Mr. Cammack presented several 2009 Amended and 2010 proposed budgets. Those presented
included WIA, West Ouachita Sewer Districts #9 & 16 and Green Acres SestacD#13.

Mr. Jackson scheduled the next budget meeting for Monday, December 14, 2009 at 5:30 p.m.
Mr. Cammack spoke briefly about the North Louisiana Crime Lab 2010 Proposed Budget. Mr
Jackson requested that their budget be included in the discussion on Monday, DecBmber 14

There being no other business to come before this committee, motion offered bykislonJac
seconded by Mr. Caldwell to adjourn. Motion passed without opposition.

The president asked for a motion to reconvene the regular meeting of the jurgn bftgred
by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Dr. Reddix to reconvene the regular meeting. gliter raeet
was reconvened at 7:10 p.m.

MOTIONS * ORDINANCES * RESOLUTIONS:

The president recognized Mr. Jackson, District A.

MR. CHARLES JACKSON, DISTRICT A:
Mr. Jackson spoke regarding the following ordinances and introduced them.

ORDINANCE NO. 8944 (Introduction Only)

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING ORDINANCE NO. 8915, ANNUAL
OPERATING BUDGET FOR GENERAL FUND, SPECIAL REVENUE
FUNDS, DEBT SERVICE FUNDS, AND CAPITAL PROJECTS FUNDS FOR
THE YEAR, 20009.

* * *

The following ordinance was introduced by Mr. Jacks

ORDINANCE NO. 8945 (Introduction Only)

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING OPERATING BUDGETS OF REVENUE
AND EXPENDITURES FOR THE FISCAL YEAR BEGINNING
JANUARY 1, 2010 AND ENDING DECEMBER 31, 2010, FOR GENERAL

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 29 of 41



FUND, SPECIAL REVENUE FUNDS, DEBT SERVICE FUNDS, AND
CAPITAL PROJECTS FUNDS.

The president recognized Mr. Calhoun, District B.

MR. CALHOUN, DISTRICT B:

The following resolution was offered for adoption by Mr. Calhourgosded by
Caldwell:

RESOLUTION NO. 09-124

A RESOLUTION REQUESTING THE LOUISIANA STATE MINERAL
BOARD TO ADVERTISE FOR AN OIL, GAS AND MINERAL LEASE ON
PROPERTY OWNED BY THE OUACHITA PARISH POLICE JURY; AN D
FURTHER PROVIDING WITH RESPECT THERETO.

WHEREAS, the Ouachita Parish Police Jury is the owner dateproperties located in
Section 6, T 17 N, R 3 E, Ouachita Parish, Lousianore particularly described on Exhibit “A”
attached hereto; and

WHEREAS, Theophilus Oil, Gas & Land Services, L.L.C. hasuesied that a mineral
lease covering said property be advertised fordmnd;

WHEREAS, the Ouachita Parish Police Jury deems it advistabladvertise the above
described tract for mineral lease by the Louisiaa#eStlineral Board,;

NOW, THEREFORE:

BE IT RESOLVED by the Ouachita Parish Police Jury in legal andleggession, that it
does hereby authorize the Louisiana State MinethEsrergy Board and the Office of Mineral
Resources to accept nominations and advertisel fgas and mineral leases, accept bids and award
oil, gas and mineral leases on the said tractsiameat herein on behalf of the Ouachita Parish
Police Jury, in the manner prescribed by law.

The above resolution was adopted tiigiay of December 2009.

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 30 of 41



The president recognized Mr. Caldwell, District C.

MR. CALDWELL, DISTRICT C :

Mr. Caldwell asked Mr. Holtzclaw to speak regarding the stati®kate Lane. Mr. Holtzclaw
updated the jury on the project with updated cost estimates. Discessard. Mr. Caldwell
asked that the parish engineer proceed with getting the n@mimation to the present
landowners and circulate the final petition.

Mr. Caldwell stated that a meeting needed to be set up to gjitbathe homeowners association
in Frenchmen’s Bend to address their drainage issues. Mr. Chltsked that this matter be
deferred until such time when that meeting could take place.

Mr. Caldwell spoke regarding the drainage issues within Treasslesdl Subdivision.
Discussion ensued. Mr. Caldwell asked that Mr. Murray get with Hltzclaw to come up
with ideas or measures for solving the problem within the subdivisian.CBMdwell asked that
this matter be placed back on the agenda for the next meeting.

Mr. Caldwell asked Mr. Mitchell to speak regarding the ULM/Coshd&ccess Channel. Mr.
Mitchell stated that he had been in contact with the parties invelmddstressed to them the
importance of this matter to the jury. Mr. Mitchell statedt thasically there had been no
movement. Mr. Caldwell asked that this matter be deferred to the next meeting.

The president recognized Dr. Reddix, District D.

DR. OLLIBETH REDDIX, DISTRICT D:

The following ordinance was introduced by Dr. Reddix.

ORDINANCE NO. 8946
(Introduction Only)

AN ORDINANCE AUTHORIZING THE SALE OF (8.782 ACRES +/-) OF THE
CONNER REALTY CORPORATION PROPERTY FOR AND IN THE
CONSIDERATION AND PRICE OF TWO HUNDRED SIXTY ONE THOUSAND
AND NO/100 ($261,000.00) DOLLARS; PROVIDING FOR A PUBLIC HEARING;
AND FURTHER PROVIDING WITH RESPECT THERETO.

* * *

OPPJ Minutes
December 7, 2009
Page 31 of 41



Dr. Reddix spoke briefly regarding the state of J. S. Clark Cemetery ardithakéhe matter
remain on the agenda in the future. Mr. Cammack stated that he had received a call from
Regions Bank and a check was in the mail in the amount of $1021.00.

MR. SHANE SMILEY, DISTRICTE :

The president spoke regarding the 2010 Proposed Meeting Calendar. The president figéed the
meetings scheduled during the months of January, February, July, Sepaechibvember that

will be held on Tuesday instead of Monday due to a holiday. Motion dffeyeMr. Smiley,
seconded by Ms. Moore to adopt the 2010 Meeting Calendar. Motion passed without opposition

The president recognized Ms. Moore, District F.

MS. PAT MOORE, DISTRICT F:

Ms. Moore asked that Mr. Holtzclaw speak regarding the Tanglewtmati Control Project.
Mr. Holtzclaw stated that he was still assessing the prajettseeking ways to fund the project.
Mr. Mitchell stated that the appraiser had sent out letierthé property owners for the
assessment of their properties. Ms. Moore asked that the iafaced back on the agenda for
the next meeting.

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS:

The president recognized Mr. Cammack, Treasurer.
FISCAL: Mr. Brad Cammack, Treasurer

Mr. Cammack stated that he had no other items.
The president recognized Chief Hemphill, Fire Department

FIRE: Chief Pat Hemphill, Fire Department
The chief stated that he had no additional items.

The president recognized Mr. Mitchell, Assistant District Attorney

LEGAL: Mr. Jay B. Mitchell, Assist. Dist. Attorney
Mr. Mitchell stated that he had no items.
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The president recognized Mr. Murray, Public Works Director.

PUBLIC WORKS: Mr. John Tom Murray , Director
Mr. Murray stated that he had no additional items.

The president recognized Mr. Holtzclaw, Engineer.

ROADS & DRAINAGE: Mr. Tom Holtzclaw, Engineer

Mr. Holtzclaw spoke regarding théouisiana Recovery Authority Projects. Mr.
Holtzclaw indicated that he would present a list of potential piojat the next jury
meeting for funding. Discussion ensued. No action was taken on this matter.

Mr. Holtzclaw spoke briefly regarding the Finks Hideaway Roaijelet. Mr. Holtzclaw
indicated that work was in progress and that he would be making repatftss project
in the future.

BEER AND WHISKEY APPLICATIONS :

Mr. Mitchell presented the following the beer and whiskey apptinati Mr. Mitchell
noted that item number 46 was the only new applicant and recommended bBpprova
Motion offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Smiley to apprinertew application

of John C. Utesch dba Christine’s for beer and whiskey. Motion passaduti
opposition.

Mr. Mitchell indicated that all other applicants were renewatsl recommended
approval. Motion offered by Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr. Calhoun to apphzve
applications for renewal as recommended. Motion passed without opposition.

1) COX, GREGORY E. DBA COX INC. DBA GENE COX'S,
2401 ARKANSAS ROAD, WEST
MONROE, LA 71291 RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D”, 2010 RENEWAL

2) AULAKH, LADDIE DBA COYOTE NY, LLC DBA
THIRSTY TURTLE, 8609 CYPRESS
STREET, WEST MONROE, LA 71291,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL
LIQUOR “CLASS C”, 2010 RENEWAL

3) AULAKH, LADDIE DBA USA TRUCKSTOP, INC., DBA 103
RESTAURANT, 987 HWY  80E,
CALHOUN, LA 71225, RETAIL BEER
“‘CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
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4) AULAKH, LADDIE

5) AULAKH, LADDIE

6) CORDELL, JOHN H.

7) CORDELL, JOHN H.

8) LAFORGE, ROBIN

9) HILL, CHARLES

10) RAPPOLD, JUNE

11) TARABA, DAVID

C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS
R”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA USA TRUCKSTOP, INC., DBA 103
TRUCK STOP, 985 HWY 80E,
CALHOUN, LA 71225, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D", 2010 RENEWAL

DBA LADLA, LLC., DBA PINE HILLS
GROCERY, 1300 HWY 80E,
CALHOUN, LA 71225, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D", 2010 RENEWAL

DBA HARDE MART #115, 104 HWY 34,
WEST MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA HARDE MART #103, 331 HWY
546, WEST MONROE, LA 71292,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL
LIQUOR “CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA NIBER INC., DBA CHENIERE
SHACK, 7975 CYPRESS STREET,
WEST MONROE, LA 71291, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR
‘CLASS C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT
“CLASS R”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA MANN'S GROCERY, 1964
HARMON JOHNSON ROAD,
MONROE, LA 71202, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA HILLSIDE GROCERY, 506 OLE
HWY 15, WEST MONROE, LA 71292,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL
LIQUOR “CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA D & J ENTERPRISES LLC., DBA
DAVE'S U-PAK-IT, 2058 HWY 139,
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12) ALIl, SHERRY C.

13) ALIl, SHERRY C.

14) HILL, MARCELLA B.

15) KANG, HARDIAL S.

16) KANG, HARDIAL S.

17) DUPREE, MARTHA

2058 HWY 139, MONROE, LA 71203,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA CAYLI, LLC., DBA J-MART
EXPRESS, 2500 ARKANSAS ROAD,
WEST MONROE, LA 71291, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA CAYLI, LLC., DBA HOUSE OF
DAIQUIRIS, 2500 ARKANSAS ROAD,
SUITE 3, WEST MONROE, LA 71291,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL
LIQUOR “CLASS C”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA THRILL HILL LOUNGE, 1205

WASHINGTON STREET, WEST
MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL BEER
“‘CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
C”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA SUPERMART, 8635 HWY 165N,
MONROE, LA 71203, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D", 2010 RENEWAL

DBA SPICE, 8649 HWY 165N, SUITE
#10, MONROE, LA 71203, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR
“‘CLASS C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT
“‘CLASS R”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA THE ARENA BILLIARDS, BAR &
GRILL, 1411 THOMAS RD, WEST
MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
C”, 2010 RENEWAL

18) MCNAUGHTON, RANDALL DBA 101 OPERATING CO., INC., DBA

101 TRAVEL PLAZA, 537 HWY 151
NORTH, CALHOUN, LA 71225,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, 2010
RENEWAL
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19) NORTON, RANDALL

20) ARRANT, JAMES E.

21) QUARLES, MIKE

22) DHILLON, SOOKHAM

23) CHRISTY, RANDALL

24) HURD, JASON

25) HOPPER, JOHN T.

DBA GOOD HOPE HANDY MART,
1800 ARKANSAS RD, WEST MONROE,
LA 71291, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B’,
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS D”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA ED’S, 1260 NEW
NATCHITOCHES RD, WEST
MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
C”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA QUARLES ENTERPRISES, INC.,
DBA THE OASIS, 417 THOMAS ROAD,
WEST MONROE, LA 71291, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR

“‘CLASS C”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA NOW SAVE #4, 101 NEW

NATCHITOCHES ROAD, WEST
MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D", 2010 RENEWAL

DBA CHRISTY SHORT STOP, 149 G.B.
COOLEY RD, WEST MONROE, LA
71291, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B,
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS D", 2010
RENEWAL

DBA MULLIGAN'S AT THE BEND,
1484 FRENCHMAN'S BEND ROAD,
MONROE, LA 71203, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS

C", RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS

R”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA JTH MANAGEMENT, LLC., DBA
HOB NOB BAR, 5078 CYPRESS ST,
WEST MONROE, LA 71291, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS C”, 2010 RENEWAL
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26) HOPPER, JOHN T.

27) MARTIN, RENEE

28) MCMILLON, JOHNNY

29) DUCHESNE, GARY

30) WILLIAMSON, DONNA

31) GOLDEN, PAUL

32) LEAR, BERNIE

33) SISSON, ELIZABETH

DBA JTH MANAGEMENT, LLC., DBA
HOB NOB, 5076 CYPRESS STREET,
WEST MONROE, LA 71291, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR
“‘CLASS C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT
“‘CLASS R”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA SAMURAI OF MONROE, LLC,,
2909 STERLINGTON RD, MONROE,
LA 71203, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS C”, RETAIL

RESTAURANT “CLASS R”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA MCMILLON’'S GROCERY, 629

HWY 3033, WEST MONROE, LA
71292, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA DUCHESNE PRAIRIE ROAD
GROCERY, 1527 PRAIRIE RD,
MONROE, LA 71202, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA TOBACCO STOP #1, 5200
CYPRESS STREET, WEST MONROE,
LA 71291, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”,
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS D", 2010
RENEWAL

DBA GET N GO, LLC., 946 OLE HWY
15, WEST MONROE, LA 71291,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA JOHNNY’S PIZZA HOUSE #4, 50
OLD STERLINGTON RD, MONROE,
LA 71203, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS R”,

2010 RENEWAL

DBA DAVID& BJS VJS LLC, DBA VJ'S
STOP & SAVE, 1013 HWY 557, WEST
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34) KOLARIK, LAURA

35) MANUEL, DAVID

36) MANUEL, DAVID

MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, 2010 RENEWAL

DBA LK ENTERTAINMENT, LLC,,

DBA BACK DOOR LOUNGE, 5266
CYPRESS STREET, WEST MONROE,
LA 71292, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS C”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA CALVERT CROSSING GOLF

CLUB, LLC DBA PINE HILLS GOLF
CLUB, 395 BRITTON RD, CALHOUN,
LA 71225, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS C”, RETAIL
RESTAURANT “CLASS R”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA CALVERT CROSSING GOLF

CLUB LLC., 515 HODGE WATSON RD,
CALHOUN, LA 71225, RETAIL BEER
“‘CLASS A", RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS
R”, 2010 RENEWAL

37) WHITTINGTON, CLAUDE DBA WHITTINGTON ENTERPRISES

38) LEAR, BERNIE

39) LEAR, BERNIE

DBA HWY 15 U-PAK-IT, 4566
WINNSBORO RD, MONROE, LA
71202, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B,
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS D", 2010
RENEWAL

DBA JOHNNY’'S PIZZA HOUSE #13,
1126 HWY 139, MONROE, LA 71203,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL
RESTAURANT “CLASS R”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA JOHNNY’'S PIZZA HOUSE #14,
102 WALLACE RD, WEST MONROE,
LA 71291, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS R’,
2010 RENEWAL
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40) LEAR, BERNIE

41) LEAR, BERNIE

42) ARYA, ASHOK

43) GUY, MARY S.

44) CASCIO, FREDDIE

45) HOLTON, JACKIE R.

46) UTESCH, JOHN C.

47) KWIATKOWSKI, KIM

DBA JOHNNY’'S PIZZA HOUSE #16,
1322 HWY 80E, CALHOUN, LA 71225,
RETAIL BEER “CLASS A", RETAIL
RESTAURANT “CLASS R”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA JOHNNY’S PIZZA HOUSE #30,
1700 THOMAS RD, WEST MONROE,
LA 71292, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A",
RETAIL RESTAURANT “CLASS R’,

2010 RENEWAL

DBA NEW EXCELL, LLC., 5073
JONESBORO RD, WEST MONROE,
LA 71292, RETAIL BEER “CLASS B”,
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS D", 2010
RENEWAL

DBA GUY'S PRIVATE BOTTLE CLUB,
1486 LA HIGHWAY 151S, CALHOUN,
LA 71225, RETAIL BOTTLE CLUB,
2010 RENEWAL

DBA FREDDIE CASCIO’S ITALIAN &
CAJUN EATERY, 4207 OLD
STERLINGTON RD, MONROE, LA
71203, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A’
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS C”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA SMITH STREET LOUNGE, 600
SMITH STREET, WEST MONROE, LA
71292, RETAIL BEER “CLASS A’
RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS C”, 2010
RENEWAL

DBA CHRISTINE'S LLC, 1304 HWY
80E, CALHOUN, LA 71225, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS A”, RETAIL LIQUOR
‘CLASS C”, RETAIL RESTAURANT
“CLASS R”, 2010 NEW

DBA CIRCLE K STORES, INC., DBA

CIRCLE K #7761, 1602 THOMAS RD,
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WEST MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

48) KWIATKOWSKI, KIM DBA CIRCLE K STORES, INC., DBA
CIRCLE K #7777, 560 LINCOLN RD,
MONROE, LA 71203, RETAIL BEER
“CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR “CLASS
D”, 2010 RENEWAL

49) KWIATKOWSKI, KIM DBA CIRCLE K STORES, INC., DBA
CIRCLE K #7763, 170 WELL RD,
WEST MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS D”, 2010 RENEWAL

50) JALALDIN, AZIM DBA SMOKER PARADISE OF
MONROE |II, LLC DBA TOBACCO
STOP #5, 1500 BAILEY STREET,
WEST MONROE, LA 71292, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“‘CLASS D", 2010 RENEWAL

51) REEVES, MICHAEL DBA M. T. REEVES, INC., DBA U-PAK-
IT #429, 2005 MARTIN LUTHER KING
DRIVE, MONROE, LA 71202, RETAIL
BEER “CLASS B”, RETAIL LIQUOR
“CLASS D7, 2010 RENEWAL

There being no other business to come before the jury, a motion veasdoffy Mr.
Jackson, seconded by Ms. Moore to go into executive session. Motion patberd
opposition. The jury went into executive session at 7:30 p.m. to discpsss@nnel
matter.

A motion offered to come out of executive session was offered hyQdldwell,
seconded by Mr. Jackson. Motion passed without opposition.

Mr. Caldwell, seconded by Mr, offered a motion. Jackson to accepe¢tbenmendation
of termination of Stephen T. Odom by Chief Hemphill. Motion passéu Ms. Moore
opposing.

A motion to adjourn was offered by Mr. Jackson, seconded by Mr. Clldwde
meeting was adjourned at 9:05 p.m.
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